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Henry James : The Turn of the Screw  before purchasing it in order to gage whether or not it would be worth my 
time, and all praised The Turn of the Screw: 

0 of 0 people found the following review helpful. One of the best Gothic novellas of all timeBy Alexandra MeehanA 
classic novella still praised to this day-- a Gothic mystery and ghost-story that probes the psyche with eerie 
undertones, many of which are sexual. You will enjoy this if you like authors like Mary Shelly, or films like Nicole 
Kidman's, "The Others". The book is still read and studied to this day while being enjoyable and creepy, a must-read 
for fans of horror and feminist theory. It is not a difficult read; the concepts and the mystery is what makes it difficult, 
and as the reader, you are the sleuth. This novella plays with the psyche (quite Freudian) and will end differently 
depending on how the reader perceives the characters. -- The book came very fast and was in great condition; just as 
advertised, and I plan to add it to my library-- also a good price.1 of 1 people found the following review helpful. A 
TRUE GEM.By D. BlankenshipOver the years I have read this short novella, "The Turn of the Screw," three times. 
My first reading was when I was very, very young and in college. This was one of the works assigned in the class I 
was taking; a literature class, and it was one of several works as I remember. I also remember that I approached this 
work with what I would call absolute pragmatic ambivalence. It had to be read, so I read it. After reading it I had to 
write a semi-short paper, so I did. I pretty well knew what the professor wanted to hear, so that is what I regurgitated 
because I wanted a good grade in that particular class. I got a good grade. I did not dislike the novel, nor did I 
particularly like it...It was simply a job I had to do.My second reading took place in a place I did not want to be. It was 
a horrible place and I simply needed something to allow me to mentally detach myself from the situation I was in. A 
friend of mine had a copy of this work which he gave to me. James' work did the job I wanted it to do at that time. I 
somewhat appreciated it at the time more than the first reading.And now we come to this current, and of course most 
recent reading; different time, different place, different motivations and to top it off...I am now old. Since the first 
human scratched the first story onto a piece of papyrus there has been literary snobbery. The epicenter of this snobbery 
centers on `literary' and `genre' fiction. On one had we are told, by those that do the telling, that genre fiction is easy to 
read, easy to digest, but holds no nutritional value what so ever. On the other side of the coin we have those people 
who tell us what we are suppose to think praising the popular novel and thumbing their noses at "literature,' claiming 
that `good literature' is in reality only a cultural artifact and the only reason we have it around is for the same reason 
we value a well carved hunk of rock that no one can really interpret or really anymore cares about. This battle, if you 
will, has been heating up of late and is of great interest to me. I love it when people do battle over books.Anyway, I 
was once again motivated to pull this small work by Henry James out and give it another go. Of all the works I know, 
this one has been analyzed, picked apart, speculated upon, and force fed to more people since it was written than any 
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other. I thought it was a good place to start. As I write this, this book most certainly cannot be considered "popular 
fiction," although it was considered just that when it was first written.I can tell you right now, before I go on, that this 
third reading absolutely mesmerized me and I loved the thing from the first page to the last. Am I smarter now? 
Probably not. As a person quickly approaching the status of "old geezer" has my outlook on life and my perceptions 
changed? Probably so. What ever the case, this book, over the years, has changed for me...I have changed; the book 
has not.This work was first published in 1898. It is a relatively short work and is considered by many to be the classic 
ghost story of that era. The premise of the plot is at first glance rather simple. A Governess is put in charge of two 
young children in or at an isolated mansion. The Governess sees ghosts - others do not, and she spends most of the 
book speculating as to how she will protect the children. Ah, but simple? No, that just ain't so! By the use of what I 
consider brilliant ambiguity, purposefully crafted by the author, we have so very, very much more than a simple ghost 
story. The arguments and discussion over this work has been raging for years and years; indeed, since it was first 
published.First, did the governess actually see ghosts - were they real? Or, as the other side would ask, is this a young 
lady with an overly active imagination touched with a bit of paranoia? Is the governess actually insane?Second we ask 
ourselves what about the children? The author has given strong hints that not all was well between the two children 
and the two people who were their former caretakers - who are by the way now dead and are indeed the two ghosts our 
young governess keeps seeing...or thinks she sees. There is a very, very strong hint of sexual impropriety here at best; 
molestation at worse. The author never tells us. Why was the young lad in the story thrown out of school? The author 
never tells us. Vague shadowy hints only.Third is linked with the first and deals with the governess's emotions and 
state of mind. There have been strong theories over the years that we are dealing with a very sexually frustrated young 
lady...frustrated to the point of tipping her over the edge. Again, we are forced to anticipate the mind of James and 
consider the time frame in which this tale takes place. (I personally view the sexually frustration theory just slightly 
lame. Most of these theories popped up during a time when the public was obsessed with such matters and just about 
every aspect of life was linked to sexuality in one way or another.) Fiction and biography tell us strongly that young 
ladies who became governesses at that time were, as a whole, a very, very frustrated group of people. They were 
almost invariably "spinsters" with little hope of marriage usually due to reduced circumstances. These young women 
were well educated and indeed were in possession of a fare degree of sophistication. No prospect of marriage, little to 
no social life, little to no income, living under the roof of strangers, facing and endless number of rules, rules and more 
rules...well, quite often these women had major issues which manifested themselves in various ways; often at the 
expense of the children. Whether or not that was the case here...well, the reader is left to decide.So ghost or 
imagination, sane or insane, sexual issues on different level or not....crafty writer, James.And then we have the writing 
style. Long, long sentences; many having multiple subjects, inserted clauses and words, words and more words. The 
author, at first glance, uses a very confusing style with convoluted sentences being the norm. This is not an easy read 
by any means. The first time I read it was the worse, but I have to tell you that even this last reading required my 
reading and rereading some of the sentences in order to fully understand what the author was saying. Ah, but that was 
the essence of the book for me. Navigating through James's prose, once I got the rhythm, was actually fun! Each 
sentence was a journey leading to another journey. I personally love this stuff! If you are put off by the style, put the 
book aside for a couple or three years and give it another shot. You may find your wait well worth it.I have read that 
some feel that this is James' greatest work. I personally would not even speculate on that since I have not read all of his 
work. I doubt it though. As to the answer to the questions brought up; those that have been discussed for years and 
years...well, to be honest with you, I just don't know. And truth be told, I don't think anyone else does either. The 
author wrote this the way he wrote it for just that reason. He has allowed each reader to come to his or her own 
conclusions - right or wrong and the author has done it well! That is the true marvel of this little book as far as I am 
concerned.Don BlankenshipThe Ozarks0 of 0 people found the following review helpful. Great story....old fashioned 
writing.By Sergio CervettiI missed reading this story in my college English Lit. class.Great story....very old fashioned 
writing. The W. Wyler film "The Heiress" is the masterpiece.

The Turn of the Screw, originally published in 1898, is a gothic ghost story novel written by Henry James. Due to its 
original content, the novel became a favourite text of academics who subscribe to New Criticism. The novel has had 
differing interpretations, often mutually exclusive. Many critics have tried to determine the exact nature of the evil 
hinted at by the story. However, others have argued that the true brilliance of the novel comes with its ability to create 
an intimate confusion and suspense for the reader.

.com The story starts conventionally enough with friends sharing ghost stories 'round the fire on Christmas Eve. One 
of the guests tells about a governess at a country house plagued by supernatural visitors. But in the hands of Henry 
James, the master of nuance, this little tale of terror is an exquisite gem of sexual and psychological ambiguity. Only 
the young governess can see the ghosts; only she suspects that the previous governess and her lover are controlling the 
two orphaned children (a girl and a boy) for some evil purpose. The household staff don't know what she's talking 
about, the children are evasive when questioned, and the master of the house (the children's uncle) is absent. Why does 



the young girl claim not to see a perfectly visible woman standing on the far side of the lake? Are the children being 
deceptive, or is the governess being paranoid? By leaving the questions unanswered, The Turn of Screw generates 
spine-tingling anxiety in its mesmerized readers. Much imitated ... but no one comes near the finesse of the master The 
Times Timelessly unsettling GuardianFrom the PublisherFounded in 1906 by J.M. Dent, the Everyman Library has 
always tried to make the best books ever written available to the greatest number of people at the lowest possible 
price. Unique editorial features that help Everyman Paperback Classics stand out from the crowd include: a leading 
scholar or literary critic's introduction to the text, a biography of the author, a chronology of her or his life and times, a 
historical selection of criticism, and a concise plot summary. All books published since 1993 have also been 
completely restyled: all type has been reset, to offer a clarity and ease of reading unique among editions of the 
classics; a vibrant, full-color cover design now complements these great texts with beautiful contemporary works of 
art. But the best feature must be Everyman's uniquely low price. Each Everyman title offers these extensive materials 
at a price that competes with the most inexpensive editions on the market-but Everyman Paperbacks have durable 
binding, quality paper, and the highest editorial and scholarly standards. 
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